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Julia Hughes 

Julia Hughes lives in Denbighshire close to the Flintshire border and is currently 
an Independent member of the Denbighshire County Council Standards 
Committee having been appointed to that position in May 2015.

Since July 2014, she has also been a Non-Executive Director on the Board of 
Grŵp Cynefin Housing Association which operates in the six North Wales 
counties and North Powys. She is a member of many of the sub committees 
including the Audit and Resources Committee (currently the Chair), Governance 
Committee and Pensions Group.

She has spent nearly 32 years of full time work in the education sector, in 
substantial Leadership and Management roles for much of that period and her 
final role was the Director of Adult and Community Learning in Conwy and 
Denbighshire for Coleg Llandrillo (part of Grwp Llandrillo Menai) with 
responsibility for four college sites, outreach provision in Conwy and 
Denbighshire, college provision in public libraries and some Higher Education, 
Work Based Learning and Commercial work.

Julia is still involved with the sector, offering educational consultancy services 
and her contracts have included Welsh Government projects and EU project 
evaluation.

Additionally she assists with the running, operation and business compliance of 
the family farm.

Her varied career and background and current activities including voluntary 
roles, together with her regular continuous professional development 
experience, provide her with a wide and varied transferable skills set and 
personal attributes which are very relevant to the membership requirements and 
work of the North Wales Fire and Rescue Authority and Flintshire County Council 
Standards Committees.


